CITY COUNCIL MEETING AGENDA
REGULAR MEETING

TUESDAY, MARCH 28, 2017

CITY COUNCIL MEETING TIME: 7:30 PM
1. Call to Order

2. Pledge of Allegiance

3. Roll Call

4. ****Consent Agenda****

All items listed under Consent Agenda are considered to be routine by Council and will be acted
on by one motion. There will be no separate discussion of these items. If discussion is desired,
that item will be removed from the Consent Agenda and will be considered separately.

a. Approval of City Council minutes from the February 28, 2017 Regular City Council
Meeting.
b. Approval of Accounts Payable; Checks Numbered 16990-17014 and 17020-17046.
For Information Checks Numbered 17015-17019 are Payroll Checks.
c. Approval of Low Bids for 2017 Gravel and Chloride Treatment Contracts.
5. Set Agenda — Anyone Not on the Agenda can be Placed Under Open/Misc.
6. Reports of Boards and Committees by Council and Staff.

7. Melissa Potter, from Hennepin County Assessor’s Office — Preliminary Presentation in
Preparation for the Board of Appeal and Equalization Meeting on April 11, 2017.

8. Director Gary Kroells, West Hennepin Public Safety - Activity Report for the Month of
February, 2017.

9. Open/Misc.

10. Adjourn.
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MINUTES OF A REGULAR MEETING OF THE
INDEPENDENCE CITY COUNCIL
TUESDAY, FEBRUARY 28, 2017 —7:30 P.M.

1. CALL TO ORDER.

Pursuant to

due call and notice thereof, a regular meeting of the Independence City Council was called to

order by Mayor Johnson at 7:30 p.m.

2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE.

Mayor Johnson led the group in the Pledge of Allegiance.

3. ROLL CALL

PRESENT:  Mayor Johnson, Councilors McCoy, Spencer and Grotting

ABSENT: Betts

STAFF: City Planner & City Administrator Mark Kaltsas, City Administrative Assistant Horner, City
Attorney Vose

VISITORS: WHPS Director Gary Kroells, Dale Hoikka, Lynda Franklin

4, ****Consent Agenda****

All items listed under Consent Agenda are considered to be routine by Council and will be acted on by one

motion. There will be no separate discussion of these items. If discussion is desired, that item will be
removed from the Consent Agenda and will be considered separately.

oo

e.
f.

Motion by

Approval of City Council minutes from the January 24, 2016 Regular City Council Meeting.
Approval of City Council minutes from the February 1, 2017 Special City Council Meeting.
Approval of the City Council minutes from the February 9, 2017 Special City Council Meeting.
Approval of Accounts Payable; Checks Numbered 16895-16926 and 16943-16989 (Check
Numbered 16972 was voided). For Information Checks Numbered 16879-16894 and 16927-
16942 are Payroll Checks.

Approval of the Non-City Assembly Permit for the Tour de Tonka Bike Ride on August 5, 2017.
Approval of an Amendment to the LMCC Joint Powers Agreement.

Grotting, second by McCoy to approve the Consent Agenda. Ayes: Johnson, Grotting, and

Spencer. Nays: None. Absent: Betts. MOTION DECLARED CARRIED.

5. SET AG

ENDA — ANYONE NOT ON THE AGENDA CAN BE PLACED UNDER OPEN/MISC.

6. REPORTS OF BOARDS AND COMMITTEES BY COUNCIL AND STAFF

Spencer attended the following meetings:
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Sensible Land Use Coalition Luncheon

Grotting attended the following meetings:

Sensible Land Use Coalition Meeting

Leadership Conference for LMC

City Council Workshop February 1%

City Council Meeting/ Work Session February 9™
LMCC Meeting

Tour of the Metropolitan waste disposal site in St. Paul
Citizens Academy

McCoy attended the following meetings:

City Council Workshop February 1%
City Council Meeting/ Work Session February 9™
Orono Schools Breakfast Presentation

Betts attended the following meetings:

Johnson attended the following meetings:

Sensible Land Use Committee Meeting x 2

Police Commission Meeting

Community Action Partnership Suburban Hennepin County Board Meeting x 2
Experienced Officials Conference

National League of Cities Conference Call

Love INC. Heartland Annual Meeting

Hennepin County Board of Commissioners Interview
City Council Workshop February 1%

City Council Meeting/ Work Session February 9™
Orono Healthy Youth Meeting

Maple Plain Fire Department Meeting

St. Paul Mayor’s Reception at the Winter Carnival
NW League of Municipalities Meeting

WeCAN Fundraiser breakfast

Regional Council of Mayors Meetings x 2

Orono School Board Meeting

Delano School Board Meeting

West Hennepin Chamber of Commerce AED Training
Drug Task Force Award Presentation

Orono Foundation Meeting

Hennepin County Healthy Living Meeting

4 Community Theatre Play

Horner attended the following meetings:
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Kaltsas attended the following meetings:
e Annual Loretto Fire Department Meeting
e City Council Workshop February 1%
e City Council Meeting/ Work Session February 9"

*Vose added that the League of Minnesota Cities Director Tom Grundhoefer passed away unexpectedly and his
funeral would be on Monday, February 27, 2017.

7. JOE BAKER, CHAIRMAN OF THE PIONEER SARAH CREEK WATERSHED MANAGEMENT
COMMISSION- PSCWC PROJECT UPDATES

Baker said the goal was to the phosphorus in Lake Sarah by 143 Ibs. per year and 535 Ibs. per year for Lake
Independence. He said there are a number of opportunities in the City to hold back runoff and improve water
quality. Baker summarized the action plan for 2017:

a) Work with the County on buffer strips

b) Move the Baker Park Ravine Partnership project forward and into the grant process

c) Consider further feasibility study of a large scale Iron Enhanced Sand filter project

d) Identify more willing landowners to explore further BMP’s

e) The City Council will be considering how best to implement the PSCWMC recommendations
regarding manure management

f) Continue to support the PSCWMC as a functioning WMO to achieve our City’s water related
objectives

Johnson asked if the City of Maple Plain was asked to share in the costs of the studies and projects. Baker said
they will most likely become a partner in the future. Johnson asked if the ravine along Budd Street made any
measurable difference. Baker noted a lot of the changes that will help will be behavioral changes and manure
management. Baker said the Selstad property is being looked at for a feasibility study as well and more
information will be provided on that at a later date.

Johnson said he appreciated Baker taking the time to get together with Koch’s. Spencer said the City is well-
served by volunteers like Baker.

8. DIRECTOR GARY KROELLS, WEST HENNEPIN PUBLIC SAFETY - ACTIVITY REPORT FOR
THE MONTH OF JANUARY, 2017.

*for a complete activity report for the month of January 2017 see the City Council packet*
Kroells noted that Independence had 337 incidents which is an increase of 43 incidents over last year.
9. COREY OEFFLING (APPLICANT / OWNER) REQUESTS THAT THE CITY CONSIDER THE

FOLLOWING ACTIONS FOR THE PROPERTY LOCATED AT 5215 SUNSET LANE (PID NO. 01-
118-24-31-0002) IN INDEPENDENCE, MN:

a. RESOLUTION 17-0228-01 Considering a variance to allow a reduced front and side yard
setback. The setback reductions would permit the construction of a new attached garage and
front porch.

Kaltsas said the Planning Commission initially reviewed this request in November of 2016. At
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that time the applicant did not have an official survey of the property and was asking the
Planning Commission to consider a variance for a reduced front and side yard setback. The
initial request made to the City included the following proposed setbacks from the front and
side yards:

Front Yard Required: 85 feet from centerline of road.

Front Yard Proposed: 45 feet from centerline of road
Variance: 40feet

Side Yard Required: 30 feet (existing home is located 19.7 feet from side property
line)

Side Yard Proposed: 16 feet
Variance: 14 feet

The Planning Commission reviewed the request and recommended approval subject to the
applicant obtaining a certified survey for the property to verify the proposed setbacks. The
applicant commissioned the survey and upon review of the proposed setbacks in relation to the
property lines determined that the garage would be considerably closer to the side lot line. In
light of the survey findings, the applicant is now proposing the following setbacks for the
garage addition:

Front Yard Required: 85 feet from centerline of road.

Front Yard Proposed: 42.1 feet from centerline of road
Variance: 42.9 feet

Side Yard Required: 30 feet (existing home is located 19.7 feet from side line)

Side Yard Proposed: 8.7 feet
Variance: 21.3 feet

Kaltsas said due to the discrepancy between the setbacks initially considered by the Planning
Commission and the newly proposed setbacks, it was necessary for the variance to be
reconsidered by the City. The applicant is proposing a side yard setback of 8.7 feet from the
west property line versus the originally proposed 16 feet. The applicant is proposing a front
yard setback of 42.1 feet from the centerline of the road versus the originally proposed 45 feet.
There are several additional considerations that should be noted by the City when reviewing
this request:

1. There is a narrow strip (30-foot-wide drainage and utility easement) of “unbuildable”
land directly adjacent to the side property line that would be closest to the proposed
structure (see depiction below). This land is part of a larger parcel owned by a
neighboring property to the east of the subject property. The owner of the strip of land
has provided a letter to the City stating that they do not object to the requested variances.
The 30 foot wide parcel provides access to the lakeshore
for the property that owns the strip. That properties access to the lake is otherwise
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limited due to an existing wetland.

2. The existing home will maintain an approximate 83-foot setback from the east property
line. The City has historically considered the combined side yard setback of a parcel as
one metric to ensure adequate access around the property.

The applicant would like to construct a new front porch and attached garage on the property.
There is currently an existing home located on the property. The existing home has an attached
garage that is located below the living area and accessed through the lower level. The applicant
recently acquired the home from his father and would like to construct a new attached garage in
a location and at an elevation that would allow access into the home at the main living level.
The lot slopes from west to east in a manner that would make it difficult to construct an addition
that could be accessed at the main living level grade.

There are several factors to consider relating to granting a variance. The City’s ordinance has
established criteria for consideration in granting a variance.

520.21. Standards for granting variances. Subdivision 1. The City Council may grant a variance
from the terms of this zoning code, including restrictions placed on nonconformities, in cases

where: 1) the variance is in harmony with the general purposes and intent of this zoning code;
2) the variance is consistent with the comprehensive plan; and 3) the applicant establishes that
there are practical difficulties in complying with the zoning code (Amended, Ord. 2011-08)

Subd. 2. An applicant for a variance must demonstrate that there are practical difficulties
in complying with the zoning code. For such purposes, “practical difficulties” means:

(@) The property owner proposes to use the property in a reasonable
manner not permitted by the zoning code;

(b) the plight of the property owner is due to circumstances unique to the
property not created by the landowner;

(c) the variance, if granted, will not alter the essential character of the locality.

Economic considerations alone do not constitute practical difficulties. Practical difficulties
include, but are not limited to, inadequate access to direct sunlight for solar energy systems.
(Amended, Ord. 2011-08)

Subd. 3. The City Council shall not grant a variance to permit a use that is not allowed
under the zoning code based on the zoning classification of the affected property.
(Amended, Ord. 2011-08)

520.23. Conditions and restrictions. The board of adjustments may recommend and the City
Council may impose conditions on a variance. Conditions must be directly related to and must
bear a rough proportionality to the impact created by the variance. (Amended, Ord. 2011-08)

Consideration of the criteria for granting a variance:
a. The applicant is proposing to use the property in a manner consistent with the Rural
Residential District. The property is wooded and positioned in a way that would reduce
the impact of the proposed garage addition. The neighborhood surrounding this
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property has a wide array of property types with varying setbacks from the front and
side yard setbacks. The applicants have attempted to locate the building in a manner
that they feel would reduce or mitigate impacts to the surrounding properties.

b. The character of the surrounding area is residential. The applicant is proposing to update
the existing home with a new front porch. The applicant is also trying to construct a new
garage that is at the same level as the main living area of the home. Currently the only
access to the home from the garage is through the basement.

c. The proposed variance would allow the expansion of a residential structure which isin
keeping with the City’s comprehensive plan.

d. The existing home is located approximately 19 feet from the side property line and
would be considered a non-conforming structure. The applicant could construct a
detached garage that would be permitted to be located within 15 feet of the side
property line.

e. The elevation of the house and overall lot makes it difficult to locate a garage to the
east of the existing home without significant changes being made to the grade. The
applicant believes that the impact from those changes would be more significant to the
surrounding properties than the plan which is proposed.

f.  The applicant is proposing to construct a new front porch on the existing home. The
front porch would encroach into the required setback approximately 10 feet. The City
could grant a variance for the porch separately if the proposed garage is not
recommended for approval.

The City will need to determine if the requested variances for a reduced front and side yard
setback meet the requirements for granting a variance.

Kaltsas said the applicant has spoken with the surrounding property owners and stated that
he generally received support of the requested variance. The City received a letter from the
property owner of 5175 Sunset Lane (owner of the adjacent strip of land to the west) stating that
they support the requested variances.

Kaltsas said Commissioners discussed the proposed variances and asked questions of staff and
the applicant. Commissioners confirmed the width of the adjacent strip of land and it was noted
that it is 30 feet in width. Commissioners asked if the proximity of the proposed garage to the road
would cause any issues with maintenance and plowing of the road. Staff confirmed that the City
had reviewed the proposed garage and believes that the setback allows for adequate maintenance of
the City’s right of way and infrastructure. Commissioners asked if any additional screening of the
proposed garage should be required by the City. The applicant noted that he is planning on
maintaining the majority of the existing trees located near the property line. In addition, the applicant
stated that he would like to plant additional screening to block headlights from getting to the home.
Commissioners were satisfied that the City did not need to require additional screening for the
proposed garage. Commissioners found that the criteria for granting a variance had been
met and recommended approval of the variances to the City Council subject to the findings and
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conditions noted in this report.

The Planning Commission recommended approval of the requested Variances with the following
findings and conditions:

1. The requested variances meet all applicable conditions and restrictions stated in Chapter
V, Section 520.19, Procedures on variances, in the City of Independence Zoning
Ordinance.

2. The requested variances were found to meet the criteria for granting a variance due to the
following conclusions:

a. The proposed garage and front porch improvements are in keeping with the
character of the surrounding neighborhood

b. The proposed property improvements will allow the property to continue to be used in
a manner consistent with the comprehensive plan.

c. The grade of the property and the proximity of the home to the property lines is
a unique condition to this property.

3. The requested variances will allow the construction of the proposed garage, mud room and
porch in accordance with the approved site plan only (the site plan will become an exhibit
of the resolution).

The approved setback variances shall be as follows:
a. Front Yard: 42.9 feet
b. Side Yard: 21.3 feet
4. The Applicant shall pay for all costs associated with the City’s review of the requested variances.

5. Any future improvements or expansion of the structure will need to be in
compliance with all applicable standards relating to the Rural Residential zoning
districts.

Spencer asked if the intention was to do a tuck-under garage. Kaltsas said he was not sure but noted this was
the applicant’s father’s home and he was trying to update it and make it more usable. Spencer said that the
way it sits now any car going around the curve would mean there are lights shining in the windows. He said
by putting in a garage that could hide or block the lights from cars which would be an improvement. Grotting
asked about the inventory of the surrounding properties in relation to setbacks. Kaltsas stated there are other
properties that have similar setbacks. Grotting noted there was no change in the existing driveway. Kaltsas
said that was a correct statement.

Motion by Spencer, second by Grotting to approve RESOLUTION 17-0228-01 for a variance to allow a
reduced front and side yard setback for the property located at 5215 sunset lane (PID no. 01-118-24-31-
0002) in Independence, MN. The setback reductions would permit the construction of a new attached
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garage and front porch. Ayes: Johnson, McCoy, Spencer and Grotting. Nays: None. Absent: Betts.
MOTION DECLARED CARRIED.

10. HOIKKA CONSTRUCTION (APPLICANT) AND BEAU’ SELLE STABLE (OWNER) REQUEST
THAT THE CITY CONSIDER THE FOLLOWING ACTIONS FOR THE PROPERTY LOCATED AT
1060 COPELAND ROAD (PID NO. 29-118-24-31-0003) IN INDEPENDENCE, MN:

a) RESOLUTION 17-0228-02 Considering an interim use permit to allow a temporary
building that is greater than 5,000 SF in association with the Commercial Riding Stable
permitted as a conditional use permit on the subject property.

Kaltsas said the property is located on the east side of Copeland Road, north of CSAH 6. The
property has an existing home, large barn, and several smaller barns and accessory
structures. There are several large pasture areas and a large area with existing tree coverage
In the Fall of 2016, the City considered and granted a conditional use permit to allow the
expansion of the existing detached accessory building (barn) to be greater than 5,000 square
feet and a commercial riding stable on the subject property. At that time the owner
anticipated commencing construction of the barn expansion in the fall and winter of
2016/2017. The construction of the barn expansion has not occurred and in January of 2017
the owner approached the City about constructing a temporary indoor riding arena on the
property. The City noted that the applicant could construct a temporary or permanent
building on the property as long as it was less than 5,000 square feet in overall size. The
applicant recently acquired a steel frame “dome” style building that is approximately 12,000
square feet in overall size. The applicant inquired about erecting the building as a temporary
structure until the permanent barn expansion is completed. The City noted that the applicant
could construct a portion of the accessory structure (up to 4,999 square feet) without needing
a conditional or interim use permit.

The applicant has already constructed a portion of the proposed temporary building. The
portion of the building that has been constructed is less than 5,000 square feet in overall
area. Properties greater than 10 acres in overall size do not have a limitation on the total
square footage permitted for accessory buildings. The applicant is seeking approval to
construct and utilize a temporary 12,000 square foot building for a period of one year from
the date of approval or six months following the completion of the permanent indoor riding
arena. This would allow the applicant time to complete the construction of the permanent
barn expansion on the property. The interim use permit would expire six months following
the completion (issuance of an occupancy permit) of the barn expansion or one year from
the City Council date of approval, whichever occurs first.

The City has two ways that it could consider allowing the temporary building to be
constructed. The City could amend the existing conditional use permit or grant a new interim
use permit. In this situation, the City recommended that the applicant apply for an interim
use permit. Interim use permits are limited to an event or date certain and allow the City to
specify a clear date or event that will cause the interim use permit to end.

The City has the following criteria for granting an Interim Use Permit:

1. The use is deemed temporary and the use conforms to the development and
performance standards of the zoning regulations.
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2. The date or event that will terminate the use can be identified with certainty.
3. Allowing the use will not impose additional costs on the public if it is necessary for
the public to take the property in the future.
4. The user agrees to any conditions that the city council deems appropriate for allowing the use.
5. The use meets the standards set forth in subsection 520.11 governing conditional use permits.

The City will need to determine if the requested interim use permit (IUP) meets all of the
aforementioned conditions and restrictions. The temporary nature of the proposed detached
accessory structure will mitigate long term impacts of the use. The proposed location of the
structure on the property appears to reduce the adverse effects on this property or the
surrounding properties.

The City has visited the site and discussed the operation of the proposed temporary detached
accessory structure with the applicant. Given the location of the property on Copeland Road, the
adjacent commercial riding stable (810 Copeland Road to the south), the orientation of the
buildings and their relationship to the surrounding properties, it appears that the proposed
application can be found to meet the requirements for granting an interim use permit to allow an
accessory structure larger than 5,000 square feet on the property.

Kaltsas said should the City consider granting approval of the IUP, the following conditions should be
considered:

1. The interim use permit shall expire six months following the completion (issuance
of an occupancy permit) of the barn expansion or one year from the City Council
date of approval, whichever occurs first.

2. All conditions of the conditional use permit for a commercial riding stable shall
apply to the temporary use of the proposed accessory structure.

3. The City has not received any written or oral comments regarding the proposed interim use permit.

4. Commissioners discussed the requested interim use permit to allow a temporary
accessory structure that is larger than 5,000 square feet. Commissioners asked
staff if the proposed temporary building met the building code life safety
requirements of a permanent building. Staff noted that the temporary building
would be required to meet all applicable building code requirements for the
proposed occupancy. Commissioners discussed the end date or event of the
interim use permit and wanted to make sure that there was a clear date that the
permit would terminate. Commissioners discussed and clarified that the
applicant could construct multiple smaller accessory structures on the property
as long as they were individually less than 5,000 square feet. Commissioners
asked the applicant how long the construction of the permanent building would
take and when they intended to commence construction. The applicant noted
that they intended to commence construction when road restrictions are lifted in
the spring of this year and that the expected construction time is 6-9 months.
Commissioners confirmed that all conditions stated in the conditional use permit
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for this property would apply to this use of the temporary accessory structure.
Commissioners found that the requested IUP met the criteria established in the
ordinance and recommended approval to the City Council.

5. Commissioners discussed the requested interim use permit to allow a temporary
accessory structure that is larger than 5,000 square feet. Commissioners asked
staff if the proposed temporary building met the building code life safety
requirements of a permanent building. Staff noted that the temporary building
would be required to meet all applicable building code requirements for the
proposed occupancy. Commissioners discussed the end date or event of the
interim use permit and wanted to make sure that there was a clear date that the
permit would terminate. Commissioners discussed and clarified that the
applicant could construct multiple smaller accessory structures on the property
as long as they were individually less than 5,000 square feet. Commissioners
asked the applicant how long the construction of the permanent building would
take and when they intended to commence construction. The applicant noted
that they intended to commence construction when road restrictions are lifted in
the spring of this year and that the expected construction time is 6-9 months.
Commissioners confirmed that all conditions stated in the conditional use permit
for this property would apply to this use of the temporary accessory structure.
Commissioners found that the requested IUP met the criteria established in the
ordinance and recommended approval to the City Council.

Kaltsas said the Planning Commission recommended approval of the request for an interim use
permit with the following findings and conditions:

1. The proposed interim use permit request meets all applicable conditions and restrictions
stated in Chapter V, Section 510, Zoning, in the City of Independence Zoning
Ordinance.

2. The interim use permit will include the following conditions:

a. The interim use permit shall expire six months following the completion (issuance of an
occupancy permit) of the permanent barn expansion or one year from the City Council
date of approval, whichever occurs first.

b. All conditions of the conditional use permit, regulating the use for a commercial riding
stable, shall apply to the temporary use of the proposed accessory structure.

I No expansion of the temporary detached accessory structure shall be
permitted on the property without the further review and approval by the
City.

3. The applicant shall pay for all costs associated with reviewing the application and
recording the resolution.
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Johnson noted the Resolution does not reference the square feet requirements. Kaltsas said that could be
added.

Motion by Spencer, second by McCoy to approve RESOLUTION 17-0228-02 granting an interim use
permit to allow a temporary building that is greater than 5,000 SF but not over than 120000 SF in
association with the Commercial Riding Stable permitted as a conditional use permit for the property
located at 1060 Copeland Road (PID No. 29-118-24-31-0003) in Independence, MN. Ayes: Johnson,
McCoy, Spencer and Grotting. Nays: None. Absent: Betts. MOTION DECLARED CARRIED.

11. RANDALL AND MARGARET MASON (APPLICANT/ OWNER) REQUESTS THAT THE CITY
CONSIDER THE FOLLOWING ACTIONS FOR THE PROPERTY LOCATED AT 3212
INDEPENDENCE ROAD (PID NO.S 13-118-24-22-0008, 13-118-24-22-0009, 12-118-24-33-0004, 12-
118-24-33-0004) IN INDEPENDENCE, MN:

a. RESOLUTION 17-0228-03 Considering a minor subdivision to combine two lots into one lot.

Kaltsas said the subject property is located along Independence Road just north of Lindgren Lane.
There are currently four tax parcels on this property due to the location of the section line which
separates school districts.

The property has access onto Lake Independence.

In 2010 the previous owner of this parcel subdivided the original lot into two (2) buildable lots.
The property was recently purchased by the applicants. They would like to combine the
properties back into one (1) lot for the purpose of constructing a single-family home on the
property. In discussing the property with the applicants, the City noted that structures constructed
on the property would need to meet all applicable building setbacks from the existing property
lines (cannot be constructed across property lines). In addition, the City noted that detached
accessory structures could not be constructed on a lot without a principle structure. This would
preclude the applicants from constructing a home on one side of the property and a detached
accessory structure on the adjacent property. As a result of this information, the applicant made
an application to the City for a minor subdivision to combine the two properties into one lot.

There are several unique aspects of this property that should be noted by the City during
consideration of the application:

1. The property is bisected by a section line that separates the Delano and Orono School Districts.
As a result, the property has four property identification (PID) numbers associated with
the two lots. In the after condition, the property will still have two PID numbers, but
only one buildable lot.

2. The previous owner paid for two sewer connections for the two properties. Any
new home construction on this property will connect to the City’s sewer on
Independence Road.

3. There was a single-family home on this property that was razed by the previous
homeowner. This property in the after condition can accommodate a new home and
meet all applicable setbacks.
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4. There is an existing driveway that provides access to this property from Independence Road.

5. The requisite drainage and utility easements will need to be re-dedicated based on the
lot combination. The applicant shall provide the City with the requisite easement legal
descriptions and execute the necessary documents to convey the required easements.

The proposed subdivision to allow a lot combination appears to meet all applicable standards of
the City’s zoning and subdivision ordinance. The combined lot will fit into the surrounding
area and have minimal impacts on the surrounding properties.

The City has not received any written comments regarding the proposed subdivision or
conditional use permit.

Planning Commissioners reviewed the request to combine the two existing properties.
Commissioners found that the request was straight forward and met the criteria for a minor
subdivision. Commissioners asked what would happen to the second sanitary sewer stub that was
purchased by the previous property owner. Staff noted that the City did not install physical stubs
along Independence Road and if the property ever subdivided in the future, the owner could request
an additional connection. Commissioners recommended approval of the requested minor
subdivision to permit a lot combination.

Kaltsas said the Planning Commission recommended approval for the requested Subdivision with the
following findings:

1. The proposed subdivision to allow a lot combination meets all applicable criteria and
conditions stated in Chapter V, Section 500, Planning and Land Use Regulations of the
City of Independence Zoning Ordinance.

2. The Applicant shall pay for all costs associated with the City’s review of the
requested minor subdivision.

3. The Applicant shall record the subdivision and City Council Resolution with the county within six
(6) months of approval.

4. The Applicant provides the legal descriptions and executes and records the requisite
drainage and utility easements with the county within six (6) months of approval.

McCoy asked why there were not utility easements already on record for these lots. Kaltsas said the City did
grant the easements but they were not recorded with the 2010 subdivision action. Kaltsas said the City is now
doing the recordings.

Motion by McCoy, second by Grotting to approve RESOLUTION 17-0228-03 considering a minor
subdivision to combine two lots into one lot for the property located at 3212 Independence Road (PID
No.s 13-118-24-22-0008, 13-118-24-22-0009, 12-118-24-33-0004, 12-118-24-33-0004) in Independence,
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MN. Ayes: Johnson, McCoy, Spencer and Grotting. Nays: None. Absent: Betts. MOTION DECLARED
CARRIED.

12. CONSIDERATION OF APPROVAL OF THE 2017 FEE SCHEDULE RELATING TO QUARTERLY
SEWER RATES:
a. RESOLUTION 17-0228-04 Considering an increase to the quarterly sewer access charge and
annual availability charge.

Kaltsas said based on direction from the City Council at the December, 2016 and February,
2017 Workshops, and staff have prepared a rate increase for both the quarterly sewer access
charge and annual sewer availability charge. The City initially commissioned the sewer rate
study in 2015. Following an iterative and careful review of the information and possible rate
increase scenarios, Council directed staff to bring forward a sewer rate increase. One of the
primary discussion points during the evaluation of the sewer rates was how to address those
users that are not currently connected, but have availability of the sanitary sewer.

Staff evaluated the total cost of maintain the system versus the total cost of operating the
system. This was done in an effort to understand if the amount proposed to be charged to
those properties that have stubbed connections was adequate to cover the cost of maintaining
the system. It was found is that the cost to maintain the system divided by the total number of
connected and stubbed users is actually substantially higher than the proposed availability
charge. It is estimated that the cost to maintain the system would actually be $755 per
property per year.

Sewer fixed

expenditures
MCES 25,750.00
Depreciation 123,600.00
Repair and Maint. 20,600.00
Capital outlay 20,600.00
Insurance 3,170.00
Claim 520.00
Total m
# of users T 257.00
Annual per user cost 755.80

The City has developed a rate increase projection that will allow those users paying the
availability charge a gradual rate increase over five years. At the end of the five years, all
residents that use or have availability to City sewer will pay the same quarterly/annual rate.
Based on the recommended rate increases, the City will be able to meet its target cash reserve
goal by the year 2025.
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The proposed 2017 rate increases will be as follows:

Connected Properties:

2016 (CURRENT): $168 per quarter 2017
(8% INCREASE): $181 per quarter

Stubbed Properties:

2016 (CURRENT): $32 per quarter 2017
(231% INCREASE): $74 per quarter

Kaltsas said it is anticipated that the City will reevaluate the sewer fund and potential rate
increases annually to ensure a nexus between the rates charged and the cost of to provide the
services to our residents. The City projects that additional rate increases will be necessary to
ensure that the sewer fund continue to support the cost to operate and maintain the system.
Should the City add additional users in the urban residential guided area, it is possible that
reduced increases could be considered in the future.

The City Council is being asked to consider RESOLUTION 17-0228-04 which would amend
the City’s current fee schedule based on the recommended sewer rate increases.

Johnson noted letters were sent out to residents and open houses were held to educate the public
and answer any questions. Johnson said the auditors could be quoted as saying something had to
be done with the sewer fund and the importance of acting now.

Motion by Spencer, second by Grotting to approve RESOLUTION 17-0228-04 to authorize an increase
to the quarterly sewer access charge and annual availability charge. Ayes: Johnson, McCoy, Spencer
and Grotting. Nays: None. Absent: Betts. MOTION DECLARED CARRIED.

13. CONSIDER AN APPROVAL TO PURCHASE A NEW VEHICLE AND LAWN MOWER FOR THE
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT.

Kaltsas said a new vehicle and lawn mower were budgeted for Public Works in the 2017 budget. Ende found
GMC Sierra 2500 for $36,000 including tax. It is equipped to pull a trailer but not to plow at this point.
Kaltsas noted local bids were accepted but could not compete with the bid from Nelson Auto Center out of
Fergus Falls. Spencer said Kaltsas and Ende had spent lots of time researching the best deal and appreciates
the due diligence.

Motion by Spencer, second by McCoy to approve the purchase of the GMC Sierra 2500 per the bid
received from Nelson Auto Center. Ayes: Johnson, McCoy, Spencer and Grotting. Nays: None. Absent:
Betts. MOTION DECLARED CARRIED.

Kaltsas said the City’s current lawn mower will require $1500-$2000 in routine maintenance costs this year
per Ende. Ende researched replacing the current mower with a Kubota diesel mower and having a larger 72”
deck installed for mowing. Ende priced out John Deere and Kubota mowers and also trade valuations. Lano
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had the most aggressive deal with a new Kubota tractor at $12,900 with our trade-in. Kaltsas said the funds
would come from the the Capital fund for Public Works equipment. Spencer said it makes sense with the
savings we are making from not outsourcing our park maintenance mowing anymore.

Motion by Spencer, second by Johnson to approve the purchase of the Kubota lawn mower per the bid
received from Lano Equipment. Ayes: Johnson, McCoy, Spencer and Grotting. Nays: None. Absent:
Betts. MOTION DECLARED CARRIED.

14. DISCUSSION OF UPCOMING CITY COUNCIL MEETING DATES.

March meetings were discussed as Kaltsas and Johnson will be absent separate weeks. Kaltsas noted there
will be a joint Meeting with the Planning Commission for the kick-off of the 2040 Comprehensive Plan.
It was decided to cancel the March 14™ meeting but to keep the March 28™ meeting as scheduled.

Motion by Spencer, second by McCoy to cancel the March 14, 2017 City Council meeting. Ayes:
Johnson, McCoy, Spencer and Grotting. Nays: None. Absent: Betts. MOTION DECLARED
CARRIED.

15. OPEN/MISCELLANEQUS

16. ADJOURN

Motion by McCoy, second by Grotting to adjourn at 9:25 p.m. Ayes: Johnson, McCoy, Spencer and
Grotting. Nays: None. Absent: Betts. MOTION DECLARED CARRIED.

Respectfully Submitted,

Trish Bemmels/ Recording Secretary
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March 21, 2017

TO: Mayor and City Council

FROM:
RE: Gravel bids

Larry Ende, Public Works Director

The City solicited bids for road gravel for 2017. Following receipt and opening of the sealed
bids, it is recommended that the following providers be used for gravel purchase in 2017:

Class 5 Gravel —Hassen Sand and Gravel — FOB and Delivered
Recycled Conbit — Hassen Sand and Gravel — FOB and Delivered
Limestone Class 2 — Bryan Rock - FOB and Delivered

GRAVEL, CONBIT AND LIMESTONE BIDS

CLASS 5 GRAVEL FOB DELIVERED
Hassen Sand and Gravel 2016/$8.50 2017/$9.00 2016/$13.25 2017/$13.75
Bryan Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Doboszenski No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
RECYCLED CONBIT FOB DELIVERED
Hassen Sand and Gravel 2016/$8.50 2017/$9.00 2016/$8.50 2017/$13.75
Bryan Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Doboszenski $9.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
LIMESTONE CLASS 2 FOB DELIVERED
Hassen Sand and Gravel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bryan Rock 2016/$10.10 2017/$16.70 | 2016/$10.10 2017/$16.70
Doboszenski No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
763-479-0527 (Phone) 1920 County Road 90 763-479-0528 (Fax)

Independence, MN 55359

http://independence.govoffice.com
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March 21, 2017
TO: Mayor and City Council
FROM: Larry Ende, Public Works Director

RE: Dust Control

The City solicited bids for road dust control (magnesium chloride application) for 2017. The
City annually budgets for providing dust control throughout the City. Based on the bid amount
for 2017, it is anticipated that the City will be at or below the budgeted amount for dust control
in 2017. Following receipt and opening of the sealed bids, it is recommended that the
following provider be used for dust control in 2017:

Envirotech for dust control.

Dust Control
Magnesium Chloride: FOB
Envirotech 2016/$0.839 2017/$0.835
Quality Propane Inc. 2016/No Bid 2017/$0.87
763-479-0527 (Phone) 1920 County Road 90 763-479-0528 (Fax)

Independence, MN 55359
http://independence.govoffice.com



Date: March 7, 2017

To: Public Safety Commissioners
City of Independence Council Members
City of Maple Plain Council Members

From: Director Gary Kroells C//%"lﬁ .

SUBJECT: FEBRUARY 2017 ACTIVITY REPORT

The purpose of this report is to give the reader a quick overview of the activities of the Public Safety
Department each month. It also compares monthly and year-to-date information to the reader.

The report is broken down into five categories, as defined by the Criminal Justice Reporting System.

CRIMINAL--

TRAFFIC--

PART llI--

PART IV--

PART V--

Criminal is broken down into Part | and Part Il crimes.

Part | includes crimes against persons versus crimes against property; criminal
homicide, forcible rape, robbery assault, aggravated assault, burglary -breaking or
entering, larceny-theft, larceny analysis, motor vehicle theft and arson.

Part Il includes other assaults, forgery and counterfeiting, fraud, embezzlement,
stolen property, buying, receiving, possession; vandalism, weapons, carrying,
possessing, etc.; prostitution and commercialized vice, sex offenses; drug abuse
violations, gambling, offenses against the family and children, driving under the
influence, liquor laws, drunkenness, disorderly conduct, vagrancy, all other
offenses, suspicion, curfew and loitering laws - persons under 18; and runaways -
persons under 18.

Includes violations of the road and driving laws.

Lost and Found: Includes lost and found persons, animals, and property, and
stalled and abandoned vehicles.

Casualties: Includes all motor vehicle accidents, boating, and snowmobile; public
home occupational accidents, fires, suicides, sudden deaths, burning permits, and
burning violations.

Miscellaneous Public: Includes open doors, gun permit applications, suspicious
activities, animal complaints, motorist assists, alarm calls, parking complaints,
house checks, driving complaints, civil matters, family disputes, department
assists.

The balance of the report shows the total number of incidents handled, miles driven and how the Public
Safety Department received calls. If anyone should desire more detailed statistical data, please contact

my office.

\\WHPS#0\share\monthlyactivityreport\2017/lettertocouncilmonthlyreport.docx

West Hennepin Public Safety Department
1918 County Road 90 / Maple Plain, Minnesota 55359
Phone: (763) 479-0500 | Fax: (763) 479-0504

Web Address: http://www.westhennepin.com  E-mail: westhennepin@uwesthennepin.com



Monthly Activity Report

February 2017

This Same Month This Year Last Year

Offense Month Last Year To Date To Date

ity Of Independence
Criminal V § 5 12 1
Traffic 198 153 370 338
Part Il 6 10 13 25
Part IV 27 30 70 70
Part V 132 127 242 263

otal City of Independence 370 325 707 707

ity aple Plain
Criminal 1 5 5 8
Traffic 103 37 210 100
Part I 5 4 6 6
Part IV 7 30 22 52
Part V 128 105 252 220

otal City Of Maple Plain 244 181 495 386

l i I !

rand Total Both Cities ‘ 614 506 1,202 1,093
TZD 0 0 1 0
Agency Assists 34 23 85 33

ota 648 529 1,287 1,126
Mileage 11,993 8,666 23,294 22,243
How Received
Fax 13 16 21 29
In Person 19 40 37 91
Mail 1 2 4 3
Other 0 5 3 18
Phone 24 29 42 63
Radio 143 189 309 359
Visual 404 213 800 488
Email 4 2 7 6
Lobby Walk In 40 33 64 - 69
[Total 648 529 1,287 1,126

MonthlyActivityReport2017.xIsx




February 2017 Criminal Part | & II

City of Independence Grid #'s 3-5
Reported MOC
AGN [ICR Title Create Date |Grid # Date range
Theft Less than $250.00 / No Pay to a
WHPS 17000702 (Private Party / Cab Driver 2/2/2017 2/2/2017|TQ991
Drugs - Possess Small Amount of
Marijuana / Drugs-Paraphernalia
Possession /Expiration of Drivers
WHPS 17000866 (License - Over 21 2/11/2017 2/10/2017|{DC500
Property Damage to YMCA Camp /
WHPS 17000919|$10,000.00 - $15,000.00 2/14/2017 2/14/2017(P3129
WHPS 17000923|Burglary - Felony 2/14/2017 2/14/2017(B0894
LIQUOR-UNDERAGE CONSUMPTION 18-
WHPS 17000926|21 2/15/2017 2/15/2017{M4140
Drugs - Possess Small Amount of
Marijuana / DAS - Driving after
WHPS 17001010|Suspension /Warrant Arrest 2/17/2017 2/17/2017|DA540
Drugs-Small Amount of Marijuana in
Motor Vehicle / Drugs-Paraphernalia
WHPS 17001096|Possession 2/21/2017 2/21/2017|DA540
February 2017 Criminal Part | & Il
City of Maple Plain Grid # 1-2
Reported MOC
AGN |ICR Title Create Date |Grid # Date range
WHPS 17001082|Damage to Property / Rainbow Park 2/21/2017 2/21/2017{P3129
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DIRECTOR’S NEWS & NOTES

WEST HENNEPIN PUBLIC SAFETY
February 2017 Activity Report

Year to Date Activity Report

At the end of February 28, 2017 West Hennepin Public Safety (WHPS) handled a total of 1,287
incident complaints, 244 incidents in Maple Plain and 370 in Independence. This is an increase of
161 incidents compared to the same time frame last year.

The Criminal Part | and Part |l cases for both cities have been highlighted for your review on the
attached documents.

Recent Highlighted Cases:

Threat

Feb 1 Vinland Center, Independence. A client was overheard making a remark about wanting
to kill someone. Staff and counselors were handling it with counseling. The caller
wanted an Officer called because he is on probation and didn’t want to get into trouble.

No Pay

Feb 2 4800 Perkinsville Rd, Independence. Taxi cab driver reported she had picked up a fare
and brought him to the 4800 block of Perkinsville Rd, Independence. The rider refused
to pay the $52.00 fare, got out of the cab and walked into his house. Police advised the
male his refusal to pay is a theft. The male knew when he called for the taxi cab; he did
not have the funds to pay and admitted his guilt. He was issued a citation for
‘Misdemeanor Theft'.

Gas Odor

Feb 3 11:26 p.m. 6800 Rachel Ridge Ct, Independence, Police responded to a report of a gas
odor and while enroute was updated a fireplace would not shut off, it was not a gas odor
call. Contact was made with the homeowner who showed Police the fireplace. Loretto
Fire arrived and corrected the issue.

Found Pigs

Feb 5 1100 Co Rd 92, Independence. Caller reported 3 pigs were in his backyard. Police
arrival; the pigs were gone, the area was searched and they were not found, unknown
who they belonged to.

Welfare Check

Feb 7 1500 Howard Ave., Maple Plain. Requested a welfare check on a male who was
agitated, threatening and uncooperative. The male was transported by ambulance to
the hospital.

Medical

Feb 9 Police were notified that North Memorial Ambulance was enroute to Vinland Center,

Independence for a male that was having issues and Police assistance was not needed.



Crash

Feb 9 Police received a call of debris in the roadway at Independence Rd & Pagenkopf Rd in
Independence. Upon Police arrival, there was a fresh set of skid marks in the
intersection and glass / debris on the roadway; no vehicle at the scene. Police found a
trail of anti-freeze on the roadway; followed it and located an unoccupied pickup truck
parked by the lake just off the roadway. The vehicle had heavy front end damage and
was leaking anti-freeze. While Police were there, a pickup came across the lake to the
damaged vehicle. Two occupants got out: the 23 year old male driver from Spring Park
stated he was following his 22 year old male friend from Delano, heading out to the
lake, his phone vibrated and he was distracted. He did not see friend stopping to turn
until it was too late and rear-ended his vehicle at the intersection. 23 year old was
issued a citation for Failure to Drive with Due Care.

Welfare Check

Feb 10 800 Copeland Rd, Independence. Received a call of one threatening suicide with a
knife. The female admitted being depressed but was not suicidal. She was transported
to the hospital to see a doctor.

Child Custody

Feb 11 At 12:23 a.m. received a call of child custody dispute. The grandparents refused to give
the father custody of his baby at 800 Copeland Rd, Independence. Police used the
Language Line to communicate with the Grandparents. A discussion with all persons
determined the baby could be given to his father and the grandparents gave him the
baby.

Intruder

Feb 11 9:33 a.m. 5300 Timber Trail, Independence 15 year old male reported an intruder was
at the house. Police arrival the caller stated it was his sister who was at home and he
didn't realize it. She was picked up by a friend and that is what he heard when he made
the 911 call, as he believed he was home alone.

Civil / Trespass Notice
Feb 12 2700 Copeland Rd, Independence. Reported a female was entering property that she
had no legal right to the property. A Trespass Notice was issued to the female.

Fraud Attempt

Feb 13 2500 Copeland Rd, Independence. A resident’s credit card company reported several
suspicious charges were made on her account. The charges were not from her
charging. The credit card was canceled and no loss to her account.

Property Damage

Feb 14 YMCA Camp lhduhapi, Independence. Damage was done to multiple cabins. The
cabins were just remodeled; no one had a chance to stay in them. Four cabins had their
front and rear doors kicked in; one had a muddy foot print on the door, had multiple
broken windows, items were thrown around inside and the floors were damaged.
Hennepin County Crime Lab responded and processed the scene for fingerprints and
DNA. Approximate damage: $15,000.00. The case is under investigation.



Burglary

Feb 14 7400 Co Rd 11, Independence. Someone entered a shed and stole hand tools, a
welder, welding helmet, grinder, drill and several other tools. Hennepin County Sheriffs
Crime Lab processed the scene for fingerprints and other DNA. The case is under
investigation. Update: Some of the stolen articles were found pawned and were
confiscated. A 37 year old male from Independence was arrested and charges pending
for Felony Receiving Stolen Property and Felony 5" Degree Drug Possession

lliness

Feb 15 Vinland Center, Independence, 40 year old male from Elk River had about 20 beers the
night prior and was going through alcohol withdrawal. The male was transported by
ambulance to the hospital to get help.

Warrant Arrest / Possession of Marijuana / DAS

Feb 17 Co Rd 11/ County Line Rd, Independence. Vehicle was stopped after an improper turn
was made. The driver 31 year old female from Columbia Heights was issued a citation
for Driving after Suspension and Possession of Small Amount of Marijuana. Passenger,
33 year old female from Minneapolis was cited for Possession of Small Amount of
Marijuana; also had a Scott County Sheriff's Office Warrant for DAS and Fail to Obey
Traffic Control. The female paid the Warrant Cash Fine of $343.00.

Utility Check

Feb 19 1100 Polo Club Rd, Independence. A resident on a walk observed what appeared to be
an exposed gas line on Turner Road. Police found an exposed gas line. CenterPoint
Energy and Xcel Energy were called and they sent a crew out to look at the exposed
line. City of Independence Public Works was contacted and advised of the exposed line
due to some serious erosion occurring on Turner Road.

Suspicious Act

Feb 20 11:38 p.m. Police observed a vehicle parked at Highway 12 / Maple Ave; later was

stopped at Highway 12 / Halgren Rd, Maple Plain, Contact with the driver who stated he
was playing "Pokémon Go" on his cell phone. It was verified he was playing Pokémon.

Property Damage

Feb 21 Maple Plain. Reported the locking mechanism for the Rainbow Park tennis court doors
were damaged. Both access doors appeared to be "pushed" open which bent the
locking mechanism for the door, allowing the door to open. The case is under
investigation.

Broken Bone

Feb 21 2800 Lindgren Rd, Independence. Police responded to a call of a four year old with a
possible broken bone. Found the 4 year old had elbow fractures and was transported by
ambulance to the hospital.

Struck Dog

Feb 21 7:04 p.m. Caller reported he was eastbound Highway 12 / Nelson Rd, Independence; a
dog ran out in front of his truck, he was unable to avoid it and struck it. He advised the
dog was dead and he moved it off of the road. Police arrival found the animal owner
from Lake Haughey Road with friends were on scene. Police helped her load her dog
into the back of her vehicle and gave her condolences on her loss.



Unwanted Person

Feb 21 1500 Howard Ave. Maple Plain. Complainant reported an unwanted, intoxicated male
was knocking on doors at the apartment. Police checked the apartment complex and
surrounding area, and were unable to locate the male.

Accident

Feb 22 Post Office truck was exiting the MP PO parking lot, struck a vehicle that was being
driven west in the eastbound lane. The driver of the struck vehicle admitted to driving on
the wrong side of the road to make dropping her mail off easier. Both vehicles had
minor damage. No injuries. Both drivers were wearing their seatbelts.

Missing Property
Feb 22 1500 Wyman Ave., Maple Plain. Reported a sapphire / diamond ring is missing or
possibly stolen from a resident. The case is under investigation.

Vandalism

Feb 23 5700 Lake Sarah Heights Dr, Independence. A resident’s vehicle was egged and flour
poured on it. At the time of the report, the owner quickly went through a car wash to
clean it, and it did not appear to have any damage. Extra Patrol for the area as the
egging and flouring of cars has been happening amongst the Rockford High School
students.

Traffic Complaint

Feb 25 Highway 12 / Baker Park Rd, Maple Plain. Received a driving complaint of a vehicle
was being driven all over the road and slowly in traffic. Police located the vehicle driving
10-15mph under the speed limit and weaving from centerline to shoulder. Contact was
made with the driver who had a revoked driver’s license. No impairment was found.
The driver was issued a citation for Driving after Revocation and Failure to Drive with
Due Care.

Neighbor Dispute

Feb 26 10:26 p.m. Police were dispatched to threats/neighbor dispute complaint of a parking lot
issue at 5200 Bryant wood Dr, Maple Plain. The Caller and neighbor were advised to try
and avoid contact with each other.

Grass Fire

Feb 27 Police responded to a grass fire on Co 11 near Lake Rebecca, Independence. Delano

Fire Dept. and a DNR Officer were on scene. Approximately 1 acre was burned and
Delano FD had it contained and extinguished. Unknown point of origin, but appeared to
have started near the roadside on Lake Rebecca Rd.

Trespassing Complaint

Feb 28 1100 Co Rd 83, Independence. Resident reported a male trespassed on his property
by pulling into his driveway and took pictures of his house. The resident wants him
charged with trespassing. No criminal intent.

Possible Theft

Feb 28 4900 Highway 12, Maple Plain. A male and female were in the store and picked up a
bottle of Vodka. They both left, did not purchase the Vodka and the store clerk could not
find the bottle they had picked up anywhere in the store. It is believed to have been
stolen.
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